
 

477 Main Street   

Monroe CT 06468 

(203) 261-1347 

 

June 29—July 10 

Mon—Fri 1:30—4:30  

Cost  $ 395 

(Supplies are included: Ben Nye make-
up kit, fabric, paints, brushes, etc.) 

Our theatre tech program is the only 
one of its kind in the area.  Students 
will experience some of  the many ex-
citing facets of theater magic behind 
the scenes. 

Stage make-up, costuming, and scenic 
painting techniques will be taught by 
expert instructors in these fields in a 
fun, and encouraging environment.  
They will work on individual projects 
that they will bring home and small 
group projects for our Renaissance 
Ballet Theater production of Peter 
Pan! 

Open to students age 8 and over.   
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Please register your student on-line at 

www.connecticutdance.com 

After you register you will receive an 
e-mail bill for  $75 to hold your  child’s 

spot in the  class.  Balance must be 
paid by June 19th Summer 2020 

at      

Connecticut 
Dance! 



Stage Make-up 

Students will enter the exciting world 
of theatrical make-up application.  Each 
student will receive her/his own stu-
dent make-up kit.  Students will learn 
techniques such as “recital”, old age, 
animal, stylized and monster plus cuts 
and scrapes.   

Costuming 
Students will gain a broad foundation 
in the necessary tools and skills needed 
for basic sewing and costuming. They 
will learn machine skills for basic cos-
tuming and the hand sewing skills 
needed for fine detail and embellish-
ment work. They will then use those 
skills to work on projects from begin-
ning to end.  

Scenic painting  
Students will gain practical skills  in 
several aspects of scenic and prop 
painting as we work on producing 
some of the  set pieces for our produc-
tion of Peter Pan. 

 


